BID TABULATION SHEET
IFB NO. 19002-FY?21-31
LEESBURG EXECUTIVE AIRPORT NORTH HANGARS

Kiewit Infrastructure Smiths Epoxy

South Co Coatings Inc

Crisak Incorporated

Lotl :Lot1l
1- CONTRACTOR QUALITY
CONTROL PROGRAM $250,000.00 NO BID $46,261.00
2 - MOBILIZATION $1,110,000.00 NO BID $0.00
3 - UNCLASSIFIED EXCAVATION $237,500.00 NO BID $375,000.00
4 - ROCK EXCAVATION $640,000.00 NO BID $685,600.00
5 - UNSUITABLE EXCAVATION $70,000.00 NO BID $42,000.00
6 - SEDIMENT TRAP $49,000.00 NO BID $35,700.00
7 - SEDIMENT BASIN $59,500.00 NO BID $54,740.00
8 - CONSTRUCTION ENTRANCE $5,000.00 NO BID $4,190.00
9 - INLET PROTECTION $10,800.00 NO BID $1,470.00
10 - CULVERT INLET PROTECTION $16,800.00 NO BID $1,960.00
11 - OUTLET PROTECTION $7,200.00 NO BID $980.00
12 - CHECK DAMS $51,000.00 NO BID $4,165.00
13 - DIVERSION DIKE $1,200.00 NO BID $4,440.00
14 - SILT FENCE $4,000.00 NO BID $3,920.00
15 - CONCRETE SWALE (4") $14,000.00 NO BID $0.00
16 - TEMPORARY MARKING $7,615.00 NO BID $4,355.78
17 - TAXIWAY MARKING $13,506.00 NO BID $13,978.71
18 - REFINED COAL TAR
EMULSION SEAL COAT $11,050.00 NO BID $12,350.00
19 - TRAFFIC DRUMS $1,590.00 NO BID $1,500.00
20 - LOW PROFILE AVIATION
BARRICADES $4,000.00 NO BID $8,000.00
21 -12" RCP, CLASS Il $10,320.00 NO BID $4,555.20
22 - 18" RCP, CLASS Il $43,240.00 NO BID $15,322.00
23 - 24" RCP, CLASS Il $112,960.00 NO BID $39,359.50
24 - VDOT STD. DI-7 $4,600.00 NO BID $4,150.00
25 - MANHOLE (MH-1) w/ FRAME
AND COVER $55,000.00 NO BID $23,350.00
26 - MODIFIED MANHOLE (MH-1)
w/ FRAME AND COVER $23,600.00 NO BID $10,650.00
27 - 18" FLARED END SECTIONS
18" $5,200.00 NO BID $3,300.00
28 - EW-1 HEADWALL $10,600.00 NO BID $6,680.00
29 - MODIFIED EW-1 HEADWALL
(STR 11) $6,500.00 NO BID $6,680.00
30 - WATER QUALITY UNIT (WQU
1) $100,000.00 NO BID $43,820.00
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31 - WATER QUALITY UNIT (WQU

2) $100,000.00 NO BID $43,820.00
32 - HDPE COLLAR $550.00 NO BID $2,280.00
33 - TEMPORARY DROP INLET $3,600.00 NO BID $4,160.00
34 - 24" HDPE SLOTTED DRAIN $478,500.00 NO BID $377,300.00
35 - 24" HDPE PIPE $14,350.00 NO BID $5,061.00
36 - HDPE DUAL WALL REDUCING
TEE $825.00 NO BID $3,015.00
37 - MANUFACTURED TREATMENT
DEVICE (STR 17) $96,000.00 NO BID $55,430.00
38 - STORM WATER
MANAGEMENT FACILITY $1,020,000.00 NO BID $558,230.00
39 - 24" GATE VALVE $66,000.00 NO BID $102,300.00
40 - CRUSHED AGGREGATE BASE
COURSE $456,000.00 NO BID $450,300.00
41 - ASPHALT CONCRETE
PAVEMENT (SM-12.5) $476,000.00 NO BID $437,920.00
42 - TEMPORARY SECURITY
FENCE $18,720.00 NO BID $9,518.40
43 - 8' x 16' TEMPORARY DOUBLE
SWING GATE $930.00 NO BID $2,000.00
44 - 8' CHAINLINK FENCE $42,750.00 NO BID $21,289.50
45 - GATE RELOCATION $1,320.00 NO BID $1,200.00
46 - TIE-DOWN ANCHORS $1,980.00 NO BID $0.00
47 - DEMOLITION $50,000.00 NO BID $20,530.00
48 - SEEDING $6,000.00 NO BID $10,688.01
49 - TOPSOILING (OBTAINED ON
SITE) $27,500.00 NO BID $7,535.00
50 - MULCHING $990.00 NO BID $14,520.00
51 - BLOCK RETAINING WALL (+/-
9" $338,000.00 NO BID $63,949.60
52 - CONCRETE SIDEWALK $21,600.00 NO BID $5,940.00
53 - 8X5 CHAINLINK PEDESTRIAN
GATE $1,100.00 NO BID $1,295.00
54 - 24' MANUAL SLIDE GATE $8,200.00 NO BID $7,450.00
55 - KNOX BOX (3200 SERIES) $700.00 NO BID $1,200.00
56 - SIGN PANEL $1,000.00 NO BID $0.00
57 - BUMPER BLOCKS $2,640.00 NO BID $0.00
58 - 12" SCH 80 PVC ROOF DRAIN $350,000.00 NO BID $185,080.00
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59 - JB-S2 JUNCTION BOX $9,000.00 NO BID $0.00
60 - 2" PVC CONDUIT SCH 40 $450.00 NO BID $150.00
61 - 4" PVC CONDUIT SCH 40 $14,310.00 NO BID $3,392.00
62 - 6" PVC CONDUIT SCH 40 $9,200.00 NO BID $4,520.00
63 - MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC -
MILLER DR. $5,000.00 NO BID $0.00
64 - EQUIPMENT RACRK $3,200.00 NO BID $8,920.00
65 - NOVEC POWER
IMPROVEMENTS $44,100.00 NO BID $35,030.00
66 - 1" TYPE K COPPER WATER
LINE $9,900.00 NO BID $7,491.00
67 - 8" D.I. WATER LINE $214,500.00 NO BID $121,935.00
68 - 2" PVC FORCE MAIN $57,500.00 NO BID $14,904.00
69 - FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY $20,000.00 NO BID $32,012.00
70 - 8" X 45 BEND $1,800.00 NO BID $10,260.00
71-8" X11.25 BEND $1,900.00 NO BID $4,520.00
72 - 8" X 4" CROSS $500.00 NO BID $1,550.00
73-8" x 6" TEE $1,080.00 NO BID $4,710.00
74 - 10" X 8" STANDARD TEE & 8"
VALVE $3,300.00 NO BID $4,470.00
75 - 8" GATE VALVE AND VALVE
BOX $24,600.00 NO BID $14,520.00
76 - 1" CORPORATION STOP $6,800.00 NO BID $2,100.00
77 - 8" PVC AWWA C-900 D25 $22,800.00 NO BID $5,436.00
78 - 6" PVC AWWA C-900 D25 $16,250.00 NO BID $1,965.00
79 - 4" PVC AWWA C-900 D25 $16,000.00 NO BID $6,880.00
80 - SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE $15,000.00 NO BID $4,670.00
81 - 6" SANITARY SEWER
CLEANOUTS $2,800.00 NO BID $1,690.00
82 - 4" SANITARY SEWER
CLEANOUTS $7,200.00 NO BID $2,880.00
83 - FORCE MAIN CLEANOUTS $12,000.00 NO BID $2,280.00
84 - 1" CAP (COPPER WATERLINE) $100.00 NO BID $681.00
85 - 1" GATE VALVE AND BOX $1,100.00 NO BID $863.00
86 - 1" X 45 BEND COPPER $100.00 NO BID $650.00
87 - METER CROCK, 1" COPPER
SETTER, 1" METER $2,200.00 NO BID $4,900.00
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88 - 4" MJ PLATE TAPPED FOR 1"

CORPORATION STOP $180.00 NO BID $2,760.00
89 - GRINDER PUMP STATION $19,000.00 NO BID $22,840.00
90 - LANDSCAPING $16,300.00 NO BID NO BID
91 - TIE INTO EXISTING
WATERLINE - MILLER DRIVE $1,300.00 NO BID $8,120.00
92 - TIE INTO EXISTING
SEWERLINE $1,000.00 NO BID $6,820.00
93 - 26-Unit T-Hangar Fabrication &
Delivery $1,223,000.00 NO BID $1,237,603.61
94 - 26-Unit T-Hangar Building
Erection $1,114,000.00 NO BID $119,437.50
Total For Lot 1: Lot 1 $9,418,506.00 NO BID PARTIAL BID
Lot2 :Lot2
1 - 26-Unit T-Hangar Foundation $677,000.00 NO BID $200,626.00
2 - 26-Unit T-Hangar
Electrical/Lighting $265,000.00 NO BID $66,000.00
3 - 26-Unit T-Hangar Drawings $110,000.00 NO BID $2,750.00
4 - 26-Unit T-Hangar Firewalls $30,000.00 NO BID $65,000.00
5 - Corporate Hangar Fabrication &
Delivery $487,000.00 NO BID $534,347.61
6 - Corporate Hangar Building
Erection $487,000.00 NO BID $92,234.00
7 - Corporate Hangar Foundation $245,000.00 NO BID $219,600.00
8 - Corporate Hangar
Electrical/Lighting $203,000.00 NO BID $50,988.00
9 - Corporate Hangar Drawings $85,000.00 NO BID $2,750.00
Total For Lot 2: Lot 2 $2,589,000.00 NO BID $1,234,295.61
Lot 3 : Lot 3 - Bid Additive 1
1 - EPOXY COATED FLOOR
_ (CORPORATE HANGAR) $38,000.00 $76,692.00 $38,500.00
Total For Lot 3: Lot 3 - Bid Additive
1 $38,000.00 $76,692.00 $38,500.00
Lot 4 : Lot 4-Bid Additive 2
1 - HANGAR BAY INFRARED
HEATING (CORPORATE HANGAR) $50,000.00 NO BID $59,400.00
Total For Lot 4 : Lot 4 - Bid Additive
2 $50,000.00 NO BID $59,400.00
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Total Bid $12,095,506.00 PARTIAL BID PARTIAL BID

PUBLIC BID OPENING NOTICE:

In accordance with the IFB, all bids were received via the Commonwealth's electronic procurement
website eVA (www.eva.virginia.gov). The bid opening for this project was held at the date and time
specified and livestreamed via Cisco Webex for accessibility to the public. This bid tabulation sheet
represents the bid amounts that were read aloud during the public bid opening. All required forms and
documentation submitted in response to this IFB will be reviewed by the Town of Leesburg.



	BidTab for EV-LA38-4527-1

