BID TABULATION SHEET
IFB NO. 100313-FY22-07
ANNUAL GENERAL HAULING AND DEBRIS REMOVAL SERVICES

Graham County Land

RJP Contracting LLC Company LLC Lawson Trucking

Lotl :Lot1l
1 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body

$68.00 $130.00 $80.00
2 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$72.00 $150.00 $80.00
3 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$68.00 $130.00 $80.00
4 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$72.00 $150.00 NO BID
5 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$68.00 $130.00 NO BID
6 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$72.00 $150.00 NO BID
7 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$68.00 $130.00 NO BID
8 - Multi-Axle Dump Truck: with
minimum 25cubic-yard dump body
$72.00 $150.00 NO BID
Total For Lot 1: Lot 1 $560.00 $1,120.00 PARTIAL BID
Total Bid $560.00 $1,120.00 PARTIAL BID

PUBLIC BID OPENING NOTICE:

In accordance with the IFB, all bids were received via the Commonwealth's electronic procurement
website eVA (www.eva.virginia.gov). The bid opening for this project was held at the date and time
specified and livestreamed via Cisco Webex for accessibility to the public. This bid tabulation sheet
represents the bid amounts that were read aloud during the public bid opening. All required forms and
documentation submitted in response to this IFB will be reviewed by the Town of Leesburg.
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